Disclaimer for Review of Plans

The San Francisco Planning Code requires that the plans of certain proposed projects be provided
to members of the public prior to the City's approval action on the project. Accordingly, any
images of plans featured on this website are provided for the primary purpose of facilitating
public input prior to the City's action. The City and County of San Francisco does not own the
copyright to these images. Please be aware that the unauthorized reproduction, distribution, or
alteration of these images may result in a violation of Federal Copyright Law (17 U.S.C.A.
Sections 101 et seq.) and that any party who seeks to reproduce or alter these images does so at his

or her own risk.

Additionally, plans provided on this website are limited to site plans, elevations and/or section
details (floor plans and structural details may not be included). These are DRAFT PLANS being
provided for public review PRIOR to the City’s approval action on the project. Final plans may
differ from those that are currently available for review.

Memo



SAN FRANCISCO
PLANNING DEPARTMENT

1650 Mission Street, Suite 400 » San Francisco, CA 94103 « Fax (415) 558-6409

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING

Hearing Date: Wednesday, July 27th, 2011

Time: Beginning at 9:30 AM
Location: City Hall, 1 Dr. Carlton B. Goodlett Place, Room 408
Case Type: Variance (Rear Yard, Front Setback, & Noncomplying Structure)
Hearing Body: Zoning Administrator
PROPERTY INFORMATION APPLICATION INFORMATION
Project Address: 359 Cumberland Street Case No.: 2010.1132V
Cross Street(s): Sanchez and Noe Building Permit:  2010.12.29.9568
Block /Lot No.: 3601/036 Applicant/Agent: Rachel Hamilton, Architect
Zoning District(s): RH-1/ 40-X Telephone: (510) 549-1312
SUD: Dolores Heights SUD E-Mail: rhamilton@hamilton-arch.com

PROJECT DESCRIPTION

The Project proposes to construct a partial third-story vertical addition (penthouse), a three-story horizontal rear
addition, and horizontal front additions at the first and second-floor, and to make fagade alterations to the existing
two-story-over-garage single-family dwelling. The rear of the existing building is built at an acute angle (slanting
toward the front property line), resulting in varied building depths at each level, with the deepest portion of the building
(at the first floor) encroaching into the required rear yard. The proposed horizontal rear additions result in a plumb or
“uniform” rear building wall.

PER SECTIONS 134 & 188 OF THE PLANNING CODE the subject property is required to maintain a 45% rear yard
of approximately 51’-4”, measured parallel to the rear property line. The existing structure currently encroaches into
the required rear yard by approximately 2’-8” resulting in a rear yard of approximately 48'-8”. The proposed alterations
would increase the existing rear yard encroachment, resulting in a maximum encroachment of 6-3”, and in a
minimum rear yard of approximately 45’-1”. This intensification of the existing noncomplying structure necessitates
variances from the rear yard (Section 134) and noncomplying structure (Section 188) provisions of the Code.

PER SECTIONS 132 & 188 OF THE PLANNING CODE the subject property is required to maintain a 13’-4” front
setback. The existing structure currently encroaches into the front setback by approximately 7’-7” resulting in a front
setback of 7°-5”. The proposed horizontal front alterations would increase the existing front setback encroachment,
by: (1) creating habitable space within the existing building volume above the garage; (2) redesigning the front bay
window at the main (first floor) level; (3) enclosing a portion of the raised entrance at the main level; and (4)
constructing a horizontal front addition at the upper (second floor) level. This intensification of the existing
noncomplying structure necessitates variances from the front setback (Section 132) and noncomplying structure
(Section 188) provisions of the Code.

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

FOR MORE INFORMATION, PLEASE CONTACT PLANNING DEPARTMENT STAFF:
Planner: Elizabeth Watty = Telephone: (415) 558-6620 E-Mail: Elizabeth.Watty@sfgov.org

ARCHITECTURAL PLANS: The site plan and elevations of the proposed project are available on the
Planning Department’s website at: http://sf-planning.org/ftp/files/notice/2010.1132V.pdf

i S Gl R G ¥R - 558.6378
Para informacién en Espanol llamar al: 558.6378



mailto:Elizabeth.Watty@sfgov.org
mailto:rhamilton@hamilton-arch.com

GENERAL INFORMATION ABOUT PROCEDURES

VARIANCE HEARING INFORMATION

Under Planning Code Section 306.3, you, as a property owner or resident within 300 feet of this proposed project or
interested party on record with the Planning Department, are being notified of this Variance Hearing. You are not
obligated to take any action. For more information regarding the proposed work, or to express concerns about the
project, please contact the Applicant/Agent or Planner listed on this notice as soon as possible. Additionally, youmay
wish to discuss the project with your neighbors and neighborhood association or improvement club, as they may already be
aware of the project.

Persons who are unable to attend the public hearing may submit written comments regarding this application to the Zoning
Administrator, Planning Department, 1650 Mission Street, Suite 400, San Francisco, CA 94103, by 5:00pm the day prior to
the hearing. These comments will be made a part of the official public record, and will be brought to the attention of the
person or persons conducting the public meeting or hearing.

BUILDING PERMIT APPLICATION INFORMATION

Under Planning Code Section 311/312, the Building Permit Application for this proposal is also subject to a 30-day
notification to occupants and owners within 150-feet of the subject property. On July 11,2011 the Department issued the
required Section 311 notification for this project (expires August 10, 2011).

BOARD OF APPEALS

An appeal of the approval (or denial) of a variance application by the Zoning Administrator may be made to the Board of
Appeals within 10 days after the Variance Decision Letter is issued by the Zoning Administrator.

An appeal of the approval (or denial) of a building permit application by the Planning Department may be made to the
Board of Appeals within 15 days after the building permit is issued (or denied) by the Director of the Department of
Building Inspection.

Appeals must be submitted in person at the Board's office at 1650 Mission Street, 3rd Floor, Room 304. For further
information about appeals to the Board of Appeals, including current fees, contact the Board of Appeals at (415) 575-6880.

ABOUT THIS NOTICE

The Planning Department is currently reviewing its processes and procedures for public notification as part of the
Universal Planning Notification (UPN) Project. The format of this Public Hearing notice was developed through the UPN
Project and is currently being utilized in a limited trial-run for notification of Variance Hearings.

If you have any comments or questions related to the UPN Project or the format of this notice, please visit our website at
http://upn.sfplanning.org for more information.

1 3 F R 56 78 - 558.6378
Para informacién en Espanol llamar al: 558.6378


http://upn.sfplanning.org/

These drawings may not be

used for construction unless
corresponding drawings

stamped and signed by the
Architect have been approved

for a building permit by the )
Building Department, and such
building permit is in the

possession of the General ‘
Contractor or Owner. ) .
DRAWING DATE PLOT DATE

16 DEC 10 25 MAR 11

# REVISIONS BY | DATE
.1 REVISED PLANNING SUBMTL DRH | 11/02/11

350 CUMBERLAND STREET, SAN FRANC]SCO, CA JEREI IR N S

PRINT DATE

PLANNING & SITE PERMIT SUBMTL (12/16/10
APN:3601-036 T

BLOCK: 3601 LOT: 036 | IR E PRI SEEM L e
PLANNING APPLICATION No: e e e T
BLDG.DEPT. PERMIT APPLICATION NO:

TITLE

=
& = INT  INTERIOR |ZONING REQUIREMENTS FOR THE "RH-1/40-X/ DOLORES HTS. S.U.D."] M EE
AT THE RATE OF : 9.U.U. PHASE | -
A@C ASPHALT CONCRETE lll\lil\'/l' L%YE-'?T I EM I m I mNG I ml A‘ O . 0 [ ] T I TL E S H E ET
ACOUS  ACOUSTICAL JsT JOIST THE WORK OF THIS PROJECT IS TO REMODEL AN EXISTING PHASE Il - A- 0.1 CONDITIONS OF
v ocesSBLE LAV pyeals Residential Density 1 Unit/ 3,000 sq. ft. lot area 1 Unit No change. RESIDENCE AND ADD NEW FLOOR AREA AS FOLLOWS: ASE I APPROVAL
ADAPT MAX MAXIMUM -
ADJ  ADIACENTORADIUSTABLE g MAGHINE SOLT e 500 S R Mo chanos GARAGE/BASEMENT: ADD NEW INTERNAL STAIR AT EXISTING A-0.2 FLOOR AREA CALCS.
ALUMN  ALUMINUM N S T ' GARAGE TO NEW ENTRY LEVEL (SEE BELOW) PHASE IV - A-0.3 DEMOLITION PLAN
ANOD  ANODIZED MISC MISCELLANEOUS _ : A-0.4 |eo OCCUPANCY & EXITING
APPROX APPROXIMATE MO MASONRY OPENING [Lot Width I 25 ft. min. | 25ft | Nochange. | ENTRY LEVEL: REMODEL EXISTING FLOOR FRAME AS REQUIRED TO A-1.0viel ISITE & ROOE PLAN
ARCH  COARD uTL - METAL Street Frontage T 5 T0 No change. CREATE ANEW ENTRY LEVEL WITHIN THE EXISTING ENVELOPE OF G E N E R A L N OT E S :
BLDG  BUILDING NA  NOTAPPLICABLE THE BUILDING BETWEEN THE EXISTING BASEMENT AND MAIN A-1.1 || |SITE SECTION
BLKG  BLOCKNG NAT  NATURAL — —— — —— FLOOR LEVELS --- 493 SF TOTAL ADDED LIVING SPACE AT THIS A- 2.0v|®| |[BASEMENT & ENTRY PLANS
20 BOTTOMOF N Noween e ont Sethac Yk o enange. LEVEL A- 2.1v[e| [MAIN & UPPER LEVEL PLANS
B BOTTOM OF FRAMING N e Al (up to 10 ft.) (Adjacent = 0 ft.) 1. ALL DIMENSIONS ARE TO FACE OF STUDS, U.O.N. DO NOT SCALE THE DRAWINGS. WRITTEN DIMENSIONS SHALL TAKE PRESIDENCE OVER SCALED DIMENSIONS. VERIFY IN FIELD ALL A~ 2 ovle| [PENTHOUSE PLANS
Bor  BOTTOM o OVER [Right Side*SetbacH No setback req'd. [ 0 ft [ Nochange. | MAIN FLOOR LEVEL: REMODELING OF EXISTING INTERIOR, DIMENSIONS AND REPORT DISCREPANCIES IMMEDIATELY TO ARCHITECT. ~ 2.2V
BUR  BUILD-UP ROOF OC ONCENTER INCLUDING LOWERING EXISTING FLOOR FRAME AT REAR OF A-3.0vie| |NORTH & SOUTH ELEVS
B CABINET O e o A Rear Setback™ 5% of Iot depth: 187 34 51" 2. THE CONTRACTOR SHALL BE SOLELY AND COMPLETEY RESPONSIBLE FOR CONDITIONS ON THE JOB SITE, INCLUDING THE SAFETY OF ALL PERSONS, PROPERTY, AND FOR ALL A-31ve| |EAST ELEVATION
CRP R st OPNG  OPENING 114 ft. x 45% = 51'-3 1/2" (See Variance Reques) RESIDENCE AS REQUIRED TO INCREASE ROOM HEIGHT BY 18" ADD NECESSARY INDEPENDENT ENGINEERING REVIEWS OF THESE CONDITIONS, AND FOR COMPLIANCE WITH O.S.H.A. SAFETY STANDARTS. ARCHITECTS AND THEIR CONSULTANTS JOB - 9.1V
CRPB CATCH BASIN 0P DRROSITE — : NEW FLOOR AREAAT FRONT AND REAR OF RESIDENCE, INCLUDING SITE OBSERVATIONS ARE NOT INTENDED TO INCLUDE REVIEW OF THE ADEQUACY OF THE CONTRACTORS SAFETY MEASURES. A- 3.2v|*| |WEST ELEVATION
B CeRAMIC D ORIVEN FASTENER |Left Side*Setback | No setback req'd. | 0 ft. | Nochange. | A MINOR INCREASE IN SIZE OF EXISTING BAY AT FRONT WALL A-33 [s| BUILDING SECTION
Cem  CEMENT o PLATE Useable Open Spad 300 5q, f 7 unt 1276 sq.f, T127 saf, —- 193 SF TOTAL ADDED LIVING SPACE AT THIS LEVEL 3. THE CONTRACTOR SHALL FAMILIARIZE HIMSELF WITH ALL SPECIFIED PRODUCTS RELATING TO HIS WORK. HE IS TO SUBMIT WRITTEN OBJECTIONS PRIOR TO BIDDING, IF THE :
cl CASTIRON PLAS  PLASTER CONTRACTOR HAS AN OBJECTION TO ANY PRODUCT AND/OR DISCREPANCIES BETWEEN DRAWINGS AND SPECIFICATIONS. A-3.4 |e BUILDING SECTION
CJ PLYWD PLYWOOD .
cLG  CEILING PR PAIR Floor Area ) Addiion £ + Addition UPPER FLOOR LEVEL: REMODELING OF EXISTING INTERIOR AND 4. THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL COORDINATE HIS WORK WITH THAT OF ANY OTHER SEPARATE CONTRACTS SUCH AS OWNER FURNISHED ITEMS, SITE ADJACENT
CLR CLEAR PT PRESSURE TREATED . . _ NEW ADDITIONS AT FRONT AND REAR OF RESIDENCE A- 4 O KITCH EN PLAN & ELEV
o T MASONRY UNIT Primary Unit Penthouse = 0 666 | 666 CONSTRUCTION, AND WORK WHICH ARE BEING DONE BY OTHERS. :
gg/lll_J ot PTN g/(\)RL?;I'/IICI\)IsL CHLORIDE Upper Floor = 716 551 1967 --- 528 SF TOTAL ADDED LIVING SPACE AT THIS LEVEL A- 4.1 BATH PLAN & ELEV
PVC - .
CONG  CONCRETE ) _ 5. THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL VERIFY ALL EXISTING CONDITIONS IN THE FIELD. THE ARCHITECT SHALL BE NOTIFIED IMMEDIATELY OF ANY DISCREPANCIES BETWEEN ACTUAL _
CONN  CONNECTION R Reem 'I\E/'r?t'” 'I:_'gfl’gl : 12089 515?12 1;4887 PENTHOUSE LEVEL: THIS IS ANEW ADDITION ABOVE THE EXISTING FIELD CONDITIONS AND CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS AND HOLD ALL WORK IN THAT AREA UNTIL SUCH DISCREPANCIES ARE RESOLVED. A-5.0 POWER & SIGNAL:
SoNTR CONTRAGTOR Rn. ROOF DRAN RESIDENCE AND INCLUDES A SMALL DECK RECESSED INTO THE 6. ALL WORK AND MATERIALS SHALL BE IN FULL ACCORDANCE WITH THE LATEST RULES AND REGULATIONS OF ALL APPLICABLE CODES (SEE LIST, THIS SHEET). NOTHING IN THESE A-S.1 POWER & SIGNAL:
Living Area Subtotal = 2005 1963 | 3968 - : : :
A REINF - RENFORCING ? TFggMSlNTg%?_FA%FDEgEﬁ/mg %Eigg AT THIS LEVEL DRAWINGS IS TO BE CONSTRUED AS TO PERMIT WORK WHICH IS NOT CONFORMING TO ALL BUILDING CODES AND APPLICABLE LAWS. A-5.2 POWER & SIGNAL:
DEPT  DEPARTMENT REQD  REQUIRED Garage/Basement = 389 145 534
7. PROTECTIVE MEASURES SHALL BE TAKEN BY THE CONTRACTOR TO SAFE GUARD ADJACENT PROPERTY AT ALL TIMES DURING CONSTRUCTION. :
PET DoUGLAS FIR R RErRESENTATIVE - THE PROJECT WILL REQUIRE A REAR YARD VARIANCE A- 6.0 REFLECTED CEILING:
DF RESIL  RESILIENT Total 2394 2108 | 4502
DIA DIAMETER RM ROOM _ — — — 8. PROTECTIVE MEASURES SHALL BE TAKEN BY THE CONTRACTOR SO AS NOT TO CAUSE OR ALLOW ANY MUD, SILT, AND OR DEBRIS ONTO PUBLIC OR ADJACENT PROPERTY. ANY MUD, LOWER FLOOR PLAN
DIAG  DIAGONAL RO ROUGH OPENING Height Limit 35 ft. max. 337 35-0 THE EXISTING RESIDENCE WAS BUILT IN 1979 AND IS NOT SUBJECT SILT, AND OR DEBRIS WHITCH ENCROACHES OR FALLS ONTO PUBLIC PROPERTY SHALL BE REMOVED IMMEDIATELY. A- 6.1 REFLECTED CEILING:
DIM RWD REDWOOD . - : .
Disp DISPENSER RWL  RAINWATER LEADER . — : TO HISTORIC REVIEW (SEE BUILDING PERMIT NO: 78-00072) 9. THE CONTRACTOR SHALL COMPLY WITH ALL CURRENT APPLICABLE LOCAL ORDINANCES FOR UTILITY SERVICES. MAIN FLOOR PLAN
DR gg\?vispow SAD SEE ARCHITECTS DRAWINGS Off-Street Parking 1 space per unit min. 1 full-size space No change. A- 6.2 REFLECTED CEILING:
DWG  DRAWNG g USTICAL TILE 1 compact space 10. THE OWNER SHALL OBTAIN ANY AND ALL REQUIRED ENCROACHMENT PERMITS FOR OFF-SITE WORK FROM THE CITY OR OTHER GOVERNING JURISDICTION. : UPPER FLOOR PLAN
(EI)EV)VR E)TQVTVliz sc SOLID CORE * NOTE: "front", "side" and "rear" designations are per their relation to Cumberland Street. A 8.0 EXTERIOR DETAILS
SCD SEE CIVIL DRAWINGS -
EA EACH SCHD  SCHEDULE :
EF EXHAUST FAN SED SEE ELECTRICAL DRAWINGS A‘ 8 . 1 EXTE R I O R D ETAI LS
EJ EXPANSION JOINT SG SEMI-GLOSS _ O R D ETAI LS
. EECT 5 o ARCHITECTURAL, MECHANICAL, ELECTRICAL SYMBOLS BUILDING CODE SUMMARY A-5.2 | | INTER
ELEC ~ ELECTIRCAL SHTG ~ SHEATHING ) ) A- 8.3 INTERIOR DETAILS
ELEV ELEVATOR SIM SIMILAR
EMER EMERGENCY SLD SEE LANDSCAPE DRAWINGS e SWITCH A‘ 9 . O D O O R S C H E D U L E
EQ b EQUIPMENT SLOGSLDING s S e TREE WAy SwTCH & cowpuTER DEDICATED OCCUPANCY GROUP: R-3 OCCUPANT LOAD FACTOR: 200 sf / occ. A- 9.1 WINDOW SCHEDULE
EwWC  ELECTRIC WATER COOLER  gnp SANITARY NAPKIN DISPENSER (X DETAIL: @7 REFERENCE GRIDEINE |XI FRAMING FOUR - WAY SWITCH ;e CONSTRUCGTION TYPE: V-B (FROM TABLE 1004.1.1) A- 9.2 FINISH SCHEDULES
EWH E')—(i%g'lngATER HEATER  spD SEE PLUMBING DRAWINGS \YYy/ TOP - DRAWNG NUMBER AT MER SWiTCH }5{ CEILING MOUNTED ALLOWABLE BUILDING AREA: 12,000 OCCUPANT LOAD: 4269 / 200 = 21.34 Occ. INTERIOR & EXTERIOR
X s SPECS  SPECIFICATIONS BOTIOM - SHEET NUMBER A SN NUMBER e i n0 o e (FROM TABLE 503) NUMBER OF EXITS REQUIRED: ONE
EXT EXTERIOR o STAINLESS STEEL e EReer HA{ ek re PROPOSED BUILDING AREA: 4,269 sq.ft (FROM SEC. 1019.2.2) EC-1.0 ENERGY CODE
P FREAARM SSK  SERVICE SINK £ secrion: © cevED NOTE g CCCUMTSENSORSMION Ay ALLOWABLE BUILDING HEIGHT: 3-STORY MINIMUM EGRESS WIDTH (TABLE 1005.1) COMPLIANCE
o FLOORDRAN D e OCTURAL DRAWINGS YY) TOP - SECTION NUMBER S0 Tk T DUPLEXOUTLET SMOKE DETECTOR (FROM TABLE 503) STAIRWAYS: 21.34 X 0.3 = 6.4" (Does not govern.)
FE  FIREEXTINGUISHER oL srenr BOTTOM - SHEET NUMBER ROOM NUMBER “©  swoneooveexourer €0 T EXISTING BUILDING HEIGHT: 2-STORY + BASEMT DOORWAYS/OTHER: 21.34 X 0.2 = 4.3" (Does not govern.)
FN - FINSH STOR  STORAGE o) o Ty ——--——  PROPERTYLINE ~&  20voLTouTLET F<T compurer NeTwoRK PROPOSED BUILDING HEIGHT: 3-STORY + BASEMT MINIMUM STAIRWAY WIDTH: 36"
iR FLOOR =i i NAYY TOP - ELEVATION NUMBER @ WINDOW NOWBER. i Oz QUADRAPLEX OUTLET HD wrercom (PODIUM SLAB CONSTR.) (From Sec. 1009.1 EXCEPTION 1) S-1.0
IEI(-)UOR Ekg(é%iSCENT v SHEET VINYL BOOTF%'I\E"T'ESEET NUMBER EXISTING WALLS TO REMAIN =$‘ ﬁ\l’?r(é:gﬁml;léTOUTLET |‘® THERMOSTAT E: SE ggg:ﬁ-‘};IIYEERgON STRUCTION: 1'::8'?\] ERATE D ?/II:I NI Mg M S,{‘;fggR\é\;AY HEADROOM: 80 S_ 2.0
T TREAD . rom oec. .
1 HOSE BIB S- 3.0
P8 O Bk ToC O OF CURS o) ELEVATION FOR SMALL SPACES: ———TThr - “Sn NrthAvPreR ouTLET A o e ALARMS: STAIRWAY TREADS & RISERS: 7.75" MAX. RISER / 10" MIN. TREAD -5 "3
FOS  FACE OF STUD 16 TEMPERED GLASS YY) BOTTOM - SHLETNUMBER (NDVIDUAL . | AS OUTLET . WATERPROOF DUPLEX SMOKE PROVIDED PER SFBC (From Sec. 1009.3 EXCEPTION 4) it
FRMG  FRAMING T8G TONGUE & GROOVE ELEVATIONSKEYEDN.E.S.W) - -22777777 WALLS TO BE REMOVED AFl OUTLET CHIME 907.2.10.1.2 ENTRANCE / EXIT DOOR: 36" X 80" S-5.0
FS FLOOR SINK THK THICK FIRE NONE S-6.0
FSR FIRE SPRINKLER RISER TO TOP OF S5 - 6.
FT FOOT TS TOP OF SHEATING
e VICINITY MAP APPLICABLE CODES PROJECT DIRECTORY SU-T_[o]ISURVEY
TRANS TRANSFORMER -
GA GAUGE TOS TOP OF SLAB
GAL GALLON
GALY CALVANIZED ;sg ;sglg:LPLATE ZONING : SAN FRANCISCO ZONING ORDINANCE & GENERAL PLAN
GB GRAB BAR UBC UNIFORM BUILDING CODE )
g::u-LAM thESI_AMINATED BEAM Bﬁo 3EE§§§E§$§§OTHERWISE BUILDING : 2007 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE AS ADOPTED AND AMMENDED BY THE CITY OF
GSM GALVANIZED SHEET METAL  VARN  VARNISH
ﬁgp %ZEUB’\I/'BWA'—'— BOARD veT VINYL COMPOSITION TILE FIRE : i&(ZN(ZC,TIS_g:gRNIA FIRE CODE AS ADOPTED AND AMMENDED BY THE CITY OF SAN
VERT VERTICAL
ﬂgp EQEE?ASORE ﬁ VERTICAL GRAIN ACCESSIBILITY : CALIFORNIA STATE TITLE 24 UNIFORM FEDERAL ACCESSIBILITY STANDARDS SHEET No
VERIFY IN FIELD (U.F.A.S) AS ADOPTED AND AMMENDED BY THE CITY OF SAN FRANCISCO )
HDR HEADER VWC VINYL WALL COVERING
HDWR  HARDWARE wi WITH 2007 CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE AS ADOPTED AND AMMENDED BY THE CITY OF
HORZ  HORIZONTAL "o ATER CLOSET MECHANICAL :  saAN FRANCISCO
WD
HT HEIGHT we m)%%pROOF PLUMBING - 2007 CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE AS ADOPTED AND AMMENDED BY THE CITY OF - .
ID INNER DIMENSION WR WATER RESISTANT SAN FRANCISCO
:g;ﬁs :g;%iﬁguw WWN WELDED WIRE FABRIC ELECTRICAL : 2007 CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE AS ADOPTED AND AMMENDED BY THE CITY OF 1 or: 11
WWM .
INSUL  INSULATION WELDED WIRE MESH (FROM GOOGLE MAPS) - N.T.S. SAN FRANCISCO

PLANNING PERMIT SUBMITTAL



. S 4.
L5 BEEES I =
< N5
< |9 < |90 O: - >
W - o |49 0 |8 96 aN =< Z 8 V .
£ o . RIS N << wd < uw = N0 LL L
. . . . . — - .. o
W < o W” _ ”W” > FEJW _%M > QO o %O B%m O o O
= : = .= @ st L9 0
o I m — .o = M - T oo - 2] N
T = = S5 =D m o) LW SM O s DE O %) = O 2 .
oM w - T o) — u o —~—© = w ©) 1
4 =22 : 2 5< z¢ ¢ Qo eEg Bog |2 : = 2
wn ” = .= O o5 S = :
=z |2 = 0= L = <O = w o> Lw = H O S I
o |Z; - EHZzE o > m MG a2 > T &T z > .. E = 3 o M W
- < v |Z: z | =2 o4 a) < W O Sz _ mﬁ E_.._._m 2 — T L A
.y JE. 5 w S S T |WZE: o o Sy oz = O W §10® o L L o || T
sc .22 T |IE S A > 1539 = =< ~ - gz I38 | °© = =Nz
s5585z::98 |le Q 2§ L= x MN 2 H_m <4 m%.m 5 — -
s STcSSgELEE = ; T > =)
.mm.mmemmmm = = o =D .= V e A o Z V = < 3 __._ILMh ) m o2
32858355 < S ” W”W”W” - %M < o W 2 5
giilizeei: |8 . |- S Eg I < T < 35
£288582388 o M a —
‘Auedwod 7 uoyiweH Jo 1udsuod ay) Inoynm pasn Jo pajealidnp aq jou Aew pue ‘Auedwod 3 uoyiweH Jo yiom paysigndun ‘eulblio ayi ainnsuod sbuimelp 8ssyl “uonoNSU0d buiouswwiod a10jaq [pjal Ul SiuswaInseaw |[e AjLaA |[eys J0Joesuo)
o
o=
0O
DS x
=zouWw
<X = S
H oM d
> Z
LL [y W =
% W W
i ) NS o
| SwvoxA —
o| W=zl o
= = O 3 <« = a
— D<A =) =
L Ll L Ll L
w w0 - S > Q)
T . <C > => Ll L
wn — 0O 0N = ~ —
|
JON3AIS3IH INIDVIrayv LV TIVM dv3H ONILSIX3 r
:MI_mm -~
VI .
0 —~
oo 2
o <
o=z e} v X
ol 3 o<
L e TEO) >-
m &) Hs 3 “x =
=—> L
¥OOT4 NIVIN 40 41VH LS3M 1V TIVM ¥VIH ONILSIX3 o & w m w >
IS I-8Y _ L <o S - 5
| 8o 2 vl
< .8-91 —
AZO_._.<O_|_n_nﬁ_< JONVIAVA 33S - n_m_\v/Ow_n_n_< A1SNOIATYd) aw
20.008.# 1IINH3d 33S) uL-SY
! /€ 9. W8~ E
— e 7 7| o _ _ _
> © —~
L
- 2k : - —
w2 — < I
] &|Z 6 « X " )
ol = 5 ' o< >
C | o= & i 035 %
ol S > a) = Z
4 o m
S =N > < O = =
o> x < 2 o o Z _]
S0 O O < = a)
I e L w > al
2|3 05 < LL
o« 0
:ml_N L O
.0-0) R @)
o - = = = = W N J ___
o A = 4/_ m M R
@) N2 x
oz > - = | Swe, = o o
& | m>s L
_N x|? o | aoO o | = M LL
m <3 7 T].0-0V L.G=2 | U @)
S |
JON3AISTIY INIOVrayv LV TIVM dV3Y ONILSIX3 _M o0 % Joaly (3) _ _ C G o
:o _\I_mm). M ___ u“
_MVL DX | m__ _ m I
A C % _ _““ T =
T -~ ! | Irt _ ®
gl & | N~
<™ | “__ NS -
«— Lo VA R
_ il Ll | &
_ e _ _ _ _ i
S
)
.0-01 m —
JON3IAISTH LNIDVrayv LV TIVM "Jv3d ONILSIX3 >
:MJmm -~ a
>l 0 a) ~ =
Q o n o w L Ll
< 14 ola © > O o 14
- n Z L oz T 3 Q < o
@) o < o o ) x O =
= O) = @) o< > E S o< )
b = L @) |- = < >
e = £ E X~ = o RS a
= o k< o o o< o n A < 4
m_uI. o S dd a — Hap 3 = Eow m = =
g =FYLs — x|l < Zls o 9 o 2 > ~ C)
o - =L = L — H WS v = m O >~ =
8  O0KOE > O 2 5 < nE O
2 o7 wQuw§ ale 2 = @ o vl o =
oz I mmwn <|oo O Z o w.__or_ _‘mw T
m M Ci_“\ — 7/ _ MM ~ ~ o b 35
< — — —
_ __ _ = — N 7 % |
W n_m & HH] gl HHHHHHHH Y e H HH H AN H HH AR HH
clo g sl 1 i e e ) Y
% W _m . THH] = H- e -HHHHHHHHHHHHHH-HM v — w HHHHHHHHHHHHHHHHHH-HHHH“HHHHHHHHHH - ~ /
o[ ~ i H L (o 2 o o [N za |r > —
Xy — e e e I e e e A A A Wz << 2 5 [HHHHHHHHA A HHHHH N s> <
ol o TR Wi H A R 0= w O w [HHHHHAHHAHH S [ _ = S
S A -Lu”u” | OH THHHHHHH] w0 O _uln > A A e | S
o= iyt A HH oHlL  HHHHM] wiplyl O0nO=> E |||||||||||||||||||||||||||||||||| — X =
w|> X ST T e P O @~ A A ¥ O o D
2l © % A H A “-q2. Alh [FNHHHH] “w o [HHHHHAHHA A /| m m /by a
o sisHRNEESESEEN 15 Nt H -~ HHHH] »  HHHHHHA AR A
@ 0 @ ST13A3T ISNOHLNIL ANV ¥3ddN H‘“ ““““““““ T P e e HHH T = HHHHHHHHHHHHHHHHH (| ot ATNO ¥OOT4 NIVIA LY N
40 47VH 1SIM LV TIVM HVIH d3S0dO¥d I~ o[ s e e —c= £~ AVE03S0dOxd 3 (3)
(MOVAL3S AYVA "¥V3IY A3HIND3IY %SY) J2/L €-1S ‘WTWWWW .... W H HAHHHH] pinininigigiy HHHHHHHHHHHHHHHHH uGL MOOT4 M3ddn LV A
““““““ . I I - I ) I Iy | MHMH HHHHHHHHHHHEHEHAHH T
ST3A3T ISNOHLINId ANV d3ddNn ‘WWMMMMM TH W H HHHHHHHHH HHHHHHHHHHHHHHHHHHHHHHH ! d3S0doyd 8 40014 Amn = m -
40 J1VH 1SV3 LV TIYM d¥3d d3S0d0dd I gl T HHHHHHHHH A A e A ] <0708 - NIV LV TV (3) = < <
__OI_Nm “‘- “““““ ||H || ] |||||||| ] gigigigigigigigigipgipipipEpEpEpEpipipEpEpEpnyn || R
— — — ——— — — o—— — —— |Lﬂhﬂﬂ.lw.r “ H m Wl_ C
13A3T HOOTd NIVIN LV T1VM dv3H d3S0d0dd | % A = /_ » m < ¢ — W w
_.—‘l_m.v B M X G | 2 — ﬂE}
! o >~ “ ol | = < o @ = af)
| = |9 S | 60% > 5 | 2 =
_ w0 =< o L - N
- i o = o
T 11z o / o o = <
25 2 .0-01 Lc-2 |u U 3
olns al
3JONIAISTY LNIOVraVy LV TIVM ¥VIY ONILSIX3 He S 390414 (@) A v
:O—‘l_mm‘( m M m “ “_“ _ F
-] I
Mnu OO | ““._. O
—— S|~ © - _ O
als @ | )
<™ | ““ R
¢ il
\“ i g
_ - Hl ] E
v u =
m @) O (@) :Ol.OF S
<O a0
Xy o
ro >3 LLI|
Amn 5 m k= 0P I
Sk L O
g wow I
<3 ~3 al -
$5 2 OF
az q=
wg <
m DI D
>

PLANNING PERMIT SUBMITTAL




314,35 4, (N)RIDGE
¢ CE

(N) PENTHOUSE

-SEE1A34 _ __ — T

"ZONING ENVELOPE" AT
XSOUTH ELEVATION

=(NyPHOTOVOLTAIC
PANEL (TYP)

COMP. SHINGLE ROOF
GALV. GUTTER AND
RWL (TYP)

STUCCO (TYP))

302.76 4 FLOOR
302.35 4 (E) ROOF \
¢

(N) & (E) UPPER
9339 4] FLIOOR|

| ——COMP. SHINGLE
ROQ

| ——(N) LIGHT FIXT. TO BE

(E
284.68 5, REAR (TB.R))

SELECTED

(E)PATID TBR.

282.72 I (N) MAIN —

(N) STAIRS AND
EXIT PASSAGEWAY

(N) PATIO LEVEL T

ADJACENT PROPERTY - 25'- 0"
(367 CUMBERLAND STREET)

SUBJECT PROPERTY - 25'- 0"
(359 CUMBERLAND STREET)

/4 PROPOSED SOUTH ELEVATION

ADJACENT PROPERTY - 25' - 0"
(357 CUMBERLAND STREET)

W SCALE: 1/8" = 1-0"

"ZONING ENVELOPE" AT
NORTH ELEVATION

—_— - SEE 1/A34 7
- — 3.
314.35, (N)RIDGE — ——r_ _]
\g
(N) SKYLIGHT
=
E)RO
A

(N) PHOTOVOLTAIC
PANEL (TYP.)

(N) COMP. SHINGLE ROOF

NFSK }zlm-\u —

OPENING IN|(N) RO
R BALCOI
OFF MABTER SUITE|

B

2'-6" SILL

293.394 (N) & (E) UPPER
A

N}DOOR TO.
REPLACE|(E) —]
(N) MAIN [FLOOR|
281.18 4 FRONT (FURR
VYOVER (E))

280.68 4, TOR OF (E) &
V{N) RAIL
28043, (F) MAINFIR

GALV. GUTTER AND
RWL (TYP)

| _—sTUCCO (TYP)

(N) SPACED WOOD $LAT|
RAIL TO|RERLACE (|
OPEN WOOD RAIL -
WOOD §IDING TO

MATCH WALL BELO

| _— ALUM. GLAD|WOOD
WINDOWS (TYP.)

(N) BLIND DOOR TO

e ADJACENT PROPERTY - 25' - 0" e SUBJECT PROPERTY - 25'- 0"

FRONT 4y it MATCH WALL FINISH
277.184 (E) & (N) TOP [ R
& St DECK H (N) STAINED|WOOD
= SIDING TO REPLACE(E)
274.064. (E) GARAGE CEILING PLYWD SIDING
Nd S
271.30,4 (N) ENTRY LEVEL — —
26918? (NYSTORAGELEVEL POWDER-COATED STEEL
hd GARAGE DOOR - COLOR
== TO MATCH WINDOWS
E | —— (E) TERRAZZO STAIRS TO
= REMAIN
(N) STAIR RAIL SIM. TO
GARAGE LEVEL S —— RAIL AT DECK (TYP.)
(E) CONC. DRIVEWAY TQ
AAIN
—

|

ADJACENT PROPERTY - 25' - 0"

| (357 CUMBERLAND STREET) (359 CUMBERLAND STREET)

/3 PROPOSED NORTH ELEVATION

(367 CUMBERLAND STREET)

W SCALE: 1/8" = 1-0"

"ZONING ENVELOPE" AT
SOUTH ELEVATION

-SEE1AS4  _ _ — T
\
\
\
\

302.35 4 (E) ROOF
¢

COMPOSITION
SHINGLE ROOFING

I

|
|
[F=siazeeass

=

ADJACENT PROPERTY - 25' - 0"
(367 CUMBERLAND STREET)

SUBJECT PROPERTY -25'-0"
(359 CUMBERLAND STREET)

/2 EXISTING SOUTH ELEVATION

I

ADJACENT PROPERTY - 25'-0"
(357 CUMBERLAND STREET)

3.0y scaLe: 1" = 10"
"ZONING ENVELOPE" AT
NORTH ELEVATION
—_ - SEE 1/A3.4
(E) RO

H

293.39,4 (N) & (E) UPPER

| ——T-111 PLYWD.
SIDING (TYP)

FLOOR o o e e B e

T

280.68 4, (E) TOP OF RAIL ‘ ‘
280434 (E) MAINIFLR N ‘
VYFRONT

277.18, (E) TOP OF DECK
hil

274.08¢ (E) GARAGE CEILING |||

- (E) GARAGE LEVEL

e

e ADJACENT PROPERTY - 25'-0" e SUBJECT PROPERTY - 25' - 0"

ADJACENT PROPERTY -25'-0"

(357 CUMBERLAND STREET) | (359 CUMBERLAND STREET)

/1 EXISTING NORTH ELEVATION

(367 CUMBERLAND STREET)

W SCALE: 1/8" = 1'-0"

SHEET NOTES

These drawings may not be

used for construction unless
corresponding drawings

stamped and signed by the
Architect have been approved

for a building permit by the
Building Department, and such
buiding permit is in the
possession of the General
Contractor or Owner.

DRAWING DATE PLOT DATE

16 DEC 2010 16 MAY 11
# REVISIONS BY | DATE

1 |REVISED PLANNING SUBMTL| DRH | 02/11/11
2 |REVISED PLANNING SUBMTL|DRH | 05/13/11

PRINT DATE

PLANNING & SITE PERMIT SUBMTL | 12/16/10
REVISED PLANNING SUBMTL 02/11/11
REFORMATTED PLANNING SUBMTL | 03/25/11
REVISED PLANNING SUBMTL 05/16/11
REVISED PLANNING SUBMITTAL | 6/16/11

PROJECT

A4 A4 \Y4

REMODELING FOR

KEYED NOTES

MARYAM MONSEF and
ALAN SAGATELYAN

359 CUMBERLAND STREET
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94114

A4 A4 \Y4

ARCHITECT

HAMILTON & COMPANY
ARCHITECTURE

, and may not be duplicated or used without the consent of H:

1035 CARLETON STREET, Ste.100
BERKELEY, CA 94710

TELEPHONE: (510) 549-1312
FACSIMILE:  (510) 549-9115
hamilco@hamilton-arch.com

CONSULTANTS

SHEET CONTENTS

NORTH & SOUTH
EXTERIOR
ELEVATIONS

LEGEND

‘DRAWN By: DRH ‘CHECKED BY: ‘

SHEET No

‘ A3.0v

18" = 10" 6 or 11

Contractor shall verify all measurements in field|before gommencing construction. These drawings constitute the original, unpublished work of Hamilton & Compan:

PLANNING PERMIT SUBMITTAL



4.68 4 (E) MAIN FLOQR-REAR

~
—~ "ZONING ENVELOPE" AT EAST |
| | ~ ( 3
I | ™~ —
| T~
™~ — I
| _ — - ~ — |
| | a : n = TOP OF 4.302.35
— X L (E)ROOF P
! I - 7
r LINE OF (E) ADJACENT | |
| j«~ RESIDENCE (BEHIND) |
| T | (E) UPPER ,293.39
T | FLOOR
| \
\
\
\

[

TOP OF (E) RAIL *280.68
E) MAIN FLOOR ¢280.43
FRONT

(E) DECK LEVEL 4.277.18
N4

LINE OF ORIGINAL GRADE !

(E) GARAGE CEILING ¢274.06

EYGARAGE $261.01'
LEVEL

2\ EXISTING EAST ELEVATION

31 SCALE: 1/8" = 1'-0"

J
/
/

Sgégké?';gg&%gag;%‘ ~ "ZONING ENVELOPE" AT EAST R ! (NJRIDGE £314.35

(N) PENTHOUSE ,.302.76
(N)BAY - ' FLOOR &
| 3 TOP OF 4302.35
| / (E)ROOF 7
76/ LINE OF (E)rRESIDENCE STUCCO (TYP)

LINE OF (E) ADJACENT
j+ RESIDENCE (BEHIND)

/(N) BAY TO REPLACE (E)
|
(N) & (E) UPPER .293.39
FLOOR ¥

/—(N) “LIVING WALL"
(N) MAIN FLOOR
FRONT (FURR

| 281.18
OVER (E))

TOP OF (E) RAIL 4.280.68
,,,,,,,,,,,,,, & (N) DECK
v — (E) MAIN FLR ,280.43
FRONT ¥

LINE OF ORIGINAL GRADE i TOP OF (E) DECK 4,277.18
AEa TO REMAIN ¥

(E) GARAGE CEILING 4,274.06
i

(N) ENTRY LEVEL 4.271.30

,,,,,,,, N) STORAGE ROOM \F269.18
R FLOOR LEVEL

/1 PROPOSED EAST ELEVATION

ARAGE ,.261.01'
. LEVEL 4

w SCALE: 1/8" = 1-0"

, and may not be duplicated or used without the consent of Hamilton & Company.

Contractor shall verify all measurements in field before commencing construction. These drawings constitute the original, unpublished work of Hamilton & Company

These drawings may not be

used for construction unless
corresponding drawings

stamped and signed by the
Architect have been approved
for a building permit by the
Building Department, and such
buiding permit is in the
possession of the General
Contractor o Owner.

DRAWING DATE PLOT DATE
16 DEC 2010 13 MAY 11

# REVISIONS BY | DATE

1 |REVISED PLANNING SUBMTL| DRH | 02/11/11
2 |[REVISED PLANNING SUBMTL| DRH | 05/13/11

PRINT DATE

PLANNING & SITE PERMIT SUBMTL | 12/16/10
REVISED PLANNING SUBMTL 02/11/11
REFORMATTED PLANNING SUBMTL | 03/25/11
REVISED PLANNING SUBMTL 05/13/11
REVISED PLANNING SUBMITTAL |6/16/11

PROJECT
\Y4 \Y4 \Y4

REMODELING FOR

MARYAM MONSEF and
ALAN SAGATELYAN

359 CUMBERLAND STREET
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94114

\Y4 \Y4 \Y4

ARCHITECT

HAMILTON & COMPANY
ARCHITECTURE

1035 CARLETON STREET, Ste.100
BERKELEY, CA 94710

TELEPHONE: (510) 549-1312
FACSIMILE:  (510) 549-9115
hamilco@hamilton-arch.com

CONSULTANTS

SHEET CONTENTS

EAST EXTERIOR
ELEVATIONS

‘ DRAWN BY: DRH ‘ CHECKED BY:

SHEET No.

A-3.1v

7 ofF: 11

SCALE:
18" = 10"

PLANNING PERMIT SUBMITTAL




m :
| - |
- - !
—
! "ZONING ENVELOPE" AT WEST fp- /l -
—
I > |
\ - / I
\ | - y \L
| \ -~ / I'\
' \
302.35,4 TOP OF (E) ROOF | — i — — 7'( | \ LINE OF (E) ADJACENT |
@ - "« RESIDENCE (BEHIND)
— | \ I
| N\
| | | \
293.39, (E) UPPER FLOOR —_ s | \
¢ e \
\
N\
| \ | N\ (E) MAIN FLOOR-.284.68
[ | — REA
280.68 s TOP OF (E) RAIL } T
I
280.43,. (E) MAIN FLR X !
UG
277.18$ (E) TOP OF DECK | ‘ LINE OF ORIGINAL GRADE
274.0S$ (E) GARAGE CEILING ! - ‘
\
S I
(E) STARS
261 .01'¢ (E) GARAGE
LEVEL
-
/
/2 EXISTING WEST ELEVATION
@ SCALE: 1/8" = 1-0"
! |
o |
| = |
_ |
! "ZONING ENVELOPE" AT WEST P /l - -
- SEE A1.1 SITE SECTION FOR
314:354 (NRIDGE ! > K SETBACK REQUIREMENTS

| 12

302.76 4, (N) PENTHOUSE FLOOR |
302.35;5 TOP OF (E) ROOF I |

STUCCO (TYP) —|

(N) BAY TO REPLACE (E)

(N) BAY

I

29339 r (N) & (E) UPPER FLOOR
(N) "LIVING WALL"
(N) MAIN FLOOR

280.68 4, TOP OF (E) &
(N) RAIL
280.43 4 (E) MAIN FLR
¥ FRONT
277.18 4 (E) TOP OF DECK
¥ TOREMAIN

274,06 4 (E) GARAGE CEILING
®

271.304 (N) ENTRY LEVEL
269.18 4 (N) STORAGE LEVEL

/1 PROPOSED

LINE OF (E) ADJACENT
" RESIDENCE (BEHIND) !
N\

X

(E) MAIN FLOOR-, 284.68
REAR (TB.R)T

WEST ELEVATION

LINE OF ORIGINAL GRADE

w SCALE: 1/8" = 1-0"

, and may not be duplicated or used without the consent of Hamilton & Company.

Contractor shall verify all measurements in field before commencing construction. These drawings constitute the original, unpublished work of Hamilton & Company

These drawings may not be

used for construction unless
corresponding drawings

stamped and signed by the
Architect have been approved
for a building permit by the
Building Department, and such
buiding permit is in the
possession of the General
Contractor o Owner.

DRAWING DATE PLOT DATE

16OBEC000 13 MAY 11
# REVISIONS BY | DATE

1 |REVISED PLANNING SUBMTL| DRH | 02/11/11
2 |[REVISED PLANNING SUBMTL| DRH | 05/13/11

PRINT DATE

PLANNING & SITE PERMIT SUBMTL | 12/16/10
REVISED PLANNING SUBMTL 02/11/11
REFORMATTED PLANNING SUBMTL | 03/25/11
REVISED PLANNING SUBMTL 05/13/11
REVISED PLANNING SUBMITTAL |6/16/11

PROJECT
\Y4 \Y4 \Y4

REMODELING FOR

MARYAM MONSEF and
ALAN SAGATELYAN

359 CUMBERLAND STREET
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94114

\Y4 \Y4 \Y4

ARCHITECT

HAMILTON & COMPANY
ARCHITECTURE

1035 CARLETON STREET, Ste.100
BERKELEY, CA 94710

TELEPHONE: (510) 549-1312
FACSIMILE:  (510) 549-9115
hamilco@hamilton-arch.com

CONSULTANTS

SHEET CONTENTS

WEST EXTERIOR
ELEVATIONS

‘ DRAWN BY: DRH ‘ CHECKED BY:

SHEET No.

A-3.2v

8 orF: 11

SCALE:
18" =1-0"

PLANNING PERMIT SUBMITTAL




44'-11 1/2"

AS SHOWN / APPROVED IN 1978 DRAWINGS
PROPERTY LINE)

(OTHERWISE WOULD BE 51.30 FEET FROM REAR

35-0"

ZONING ENVELOPE PER SFPC SEC. 241 AND 102.12

BEDROOM

ﬂ.

10-0"

TOP OF 4.302.35

(E) ROOF ¥

DINING
ROOM

/ 2\ EXISTING SECTION

|
=

MSTR.
BEDROO

350"

(E) UPPER 4,293.39
FLOOR ¥

TOP OF (E) RAIL $280.68
E) MAIN FLR ¢280.43

FRONT

(E) TOP OF DECK 4,277.18
¢

~
~

> — GARAGE

(E) GARAGE CEILING },274.06
hi

16-10"

~

N,

(E) GARAGE

LEVEL 4.261.01'
P

ORIGINAL GRADE AT EAST PROP. LINE -
ASSUMED GRADE PER PLANNING CODE

LINE OF CURB

T.O.C. AT EAST PROP. LINE

T.0.C. AT MIDLINE OF PROPERTY
(PROJECTED)

T.0.C. AT WEST PROP. LINE

w SCALE: 1/8" = 1-0"

/1 PROPOSED SECTION

KITCHEN/FAMILY
ROOM

~

-

\\\

ZONING ENVELOPE AT EAST PROP. LINE
(PER SFPC SEC. 241 AND 102.12)

/

10-0"

STORAGE \|

LOFT

(N)RIDGE ,.314.35
Nd

(N) PENTHOUSE ,.302.76
FLOOR
TOP OF 4.302.35

—

(E)ROOF P

(N) WOOD
[ [ RALLTO
REPLACE
(E)

(N) & (E) UPPER ,.293.39
FLOOR P

(N) MAIN FLOOR
FRONT (FURR 4.281.18
OVER (E))

TOP OF ,.280.68
/" (N) & (E) RAIL 4

(E) MAIN FLR ,280.43
FRONT ¥

(E) TOP OF DECK 4,277.18
TO REMAIN ¥

STORAGE

—

~
GARAGE

(E) GARAGE CEILING ,,274.06
¢

(N) ENTRY LEVEL

(N) STORAGE ROOM
OOR LEVEL

271.30
269.18

LEVEL 261.01'
X

ORIGINAL GRADE AT EAST PROP. LINE
LINE OF CURB

T \
T.O.C. AT EAST PROP. LINE

T.O.C. AT MIDLINE OF PROPERTY
(PROJECTED)

T.O.C. AT WEST PROP. LINE

SCALE: 1/8" = 1-0"

-3.3v,

, and may not be duplicated or used without the consent of Hamilton & Company.

Contractor shall verify all measurements in field before commencing construction. These drawings constitute the original, unpublished work of Hamilton & Compan:

These drawings may not be

used for construction unless
corresponding drawings

stamped and signed by the
Architect have been approved

for a building permit by the
Building Department, and such
buiding permit is in the
possession of the General
Contractor or Owner.

PLOT DATE

DRAWING DATE
16 DERR010 13 MAY 11
# REVISIONS BY | DATE

1 |REVISED PLANNING SUBMTL| DRH
2 |REVISED PLANNING SUBMTL| DRH

02/11/11
05/13/11

PRINT DATE

PLANNING & SITE PERMIT SUBMTL
REVISED PLANNING SUBMTL
REFORMATTED PLANNING SUBMTL
REVISED PLANNING SUBMTL
REVISED PLANNING SUBMITTAL
REVISED PLANNING SUBMITTAL

12/16/10
02/11/11
03/25/11
05/13/11
6/16/11
6/24/11

PROJECT
\Y4 A4 \Y4

REMODELING FOR

MARYAM MONSEF and
ALAN SAGATELYAN

359 CUMBERLAND STREET
SAN FRANCISCO, CA 94114

\Y4 A4 \Y4

ARCHITECT

HAMILTON & COMPANY
ARCHITECTURE

1035 CARLETON STREET, Ste.100
BERKELEY, CA 94710

TELEPHONE: (510) 549-1312
FACSIMILE:  (510) 549-9115
hamilco@hamilton-arch.com

CONSULTANTS

SHEET CONTENTS

BUILDING
SECTIONS

‘ DRAWN BY: DRH ‘ CHECKED BY: ‘

SHEET No

SCALE:
1/8"=1-0"

A-3.4v

PLANNING PERMIT SUBMITTAL



	Online Plans Disclaimer
	Disclaimer for Review of Plans

	Variance Notice
	On-line plans without floor plans
	A0.0 Title Sheet
	A1.0v Site & Roof Plan
	A3.0v N & S Elevations
	A3.1v East Elevations
	A3.2v West Elevations
	A3.3v Sections


